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Mentoring and
Career Outcomes

Conceptual and Methodological
Issues in an Emerging Literature

Thomas W. Dougherty

George F. Dreher

Over the approximately 20-year span of research on mentoring in the
workplace, one of the key research questions pertains to the value of men-
tors and mentoring for the career success of protégés. Researchers in the

early 1990s began to publish work that investigated (along with other issues)
whether mentoring received by protégés was related to their objective career
progress as measured by variables such as promotion rates and compensation
(e.g., Dreher & Ash, 1990; Scandura, 1992; Turban & Dougherty, 1994; Whitely,
Dougherty, & Dreher, 1991). Scholars soon acknowledged that the construct of
career success includes more than objective outcomes, and they began to include
subjective outcomes of mentoring, including perceived career success, career expec-
tations, organizational justice, job involvement, job satisfaction, organizational
commitment, intention to stay, job burnout, and organizational power, among
other outcomes (Fagan & Walter, 1982; Fagenson, 1988; Koberg, Boss, & Goodman,
1998). In this chapter, we provide an overview of a variety of issues regarding the
relationships of mentoring to the receipt of protégé career outcomes. First, we
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provide an overview of empirical research on this topic, including key characteris-
tics of past studies. Next, we discuss definitional issues in mentoring research and
implications for future studies, followed by some additional conceptual issues
related to broadening the criteria used in studies of mentoring and career out-
comes. We then highlight some research design issues that are particularly relevant
for the study of mentoring and protégé career outcomes, including internal valid-
ity, method variance, and external validity issues. Finally, we turn to discussion of
the need for a better understanding of intermediate linkages—or specific paths—
by which mentors can influence the career trajectories of protégés, followed by
some concluding comments. We now turn to an overview of key findings of the
studies that constitute this literature.

Mentoring and Career Outcomes:
Where We Have Been

Empirical Research Results on Mentoring
and Career Outcomes

Within the past 5 years, three major mentoring reviews relevant to this chapter
have been published. These include two recent monographs on mentoring by Noe,
Greenberger, and Wang (2002) and Wanberg, Welsh, and Hezlett (2003) and a
meta-analysis focused specifically on research examining mentoring’s career bene-
fits for protégés by Allen, Eby, Poteet, Lentz, and Lima (2004). We now provide an
overview of findings and conclusions relevant to the focus of this chapter.

Noe et al. (2002) delineated both the proximal (more immediate) and distal
(longer-term) outcomes of mentoring for protégés. They categorized proximal out-
comes as including the various mentoring functions received by protégés, includ-
ing psychosocial, career-related, and role-modeling functions. They suggested a
number of distal outcomes for protégés, such as promotions, compensation, work
alienation, job involvement, and perceived career success. Noe et al. discussed a
variety of issues and suggested new directions in the study of mentoring. They
reported that their reading of the literature led them to conclude that mentored
individuals (versus nonmentored) report more career and job satisfaction, promo-
tions, higher incomes, and lower turnover intentions and work alienation.
However, their monograph did not systematically or in a detailed fashion review
the literature focusing on mentoring and protégé career outcomes.

Wanberg and colleagues (2003) provided a lengthy and comprehensive review of
the workplace mentoring literature, with a special review and discussion of formal
mentoring. Their review included a table summarizing key characteristics of stud-
ies of both protégé and mentor outcomes. These characteristics included focus,
methodology, type of mentoring examined, source of data, and sample size—
reporting that most studies used cross-sectional surveys, relied upon self-reports,
and focused on protégé (versus mentor) outcomes. Sample sizes ranged from 22 to
3,321, with most sample sizes over 100. Wanberg et al. noted that it was difficult
to code studies on the formal/informal dimension, in that many authors did not
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explicitly make this distinction. They did not indicate any explicit criteria for inclu-
sion of studies generating their summary statistics on these studies examining out-
comes. Moreover, they did not identify the individual studies included in these
summary statistics or provide a review of these studies, pointing out the difficulty
of such a narrative review. They did summarize the results of the (early version of
the) Allen et al. (2004) meta-analysis in reporting an overall synthesis of protégé
outcome results across studies. In addition, Wanberg et al. (2003) cited some
research issues and priorities, including differentiating formal from informal men-
toring, using control variables and longitudinal studies to confirm the “incremen-
tal” value of mentoring beyond protégé characteristics, examining the mechanisms
through which mentoring leads to career success (offering a detailed model for for-
mal mentoring in their monograph), examining work performance-related out-
comes, and examining multiple mentors and negative mentoring experiences. We
take up a number of these issues in the present chapter.

In regard to the meta-analytic review by Allen et al. (2004), they provided some
explicit criteria for inclusion of studies in their analysis and a systematic review and
synthesis of research on protégé outcomes from workplace mentoring. Therefore, it
makes sense in the present chapter to focus attention on their findings about mentor-
ing and protégé outcomes as a springboard for our discussion of conceptual and
methodological issues. We also provide a study-by-study overview of research charac-
teristics and results of their 43 studies, displayed in Table 3.1. We chose to add 4 more
recently published studies of mentoring and protégé outcomes to Table 3.1 (Gonzalez-
Figueroa & Young, 2005; Kirchmeyer, 2005; Payne & Huffman, 2005; Scandura &
Williams, 2004), which fit the Allen et al. (2004) criteria for inclusion in analyses.

Allen et al. (2004) included both objective (e.g., compensation) and subjective
(e.g., career satisfaction) outcomes and studies examining both “amount of men-
toring provided” and studies configured as comparisons of “mentored versus non-
mentored” individuals. For inclusion in the meta-analysis, a study had to have
reported the sample size, been conducted in an organizational setting, collected
separate measures of major mentoring functions (e.g., career, psychosocial), and
reported a relationship(s) between mentoring and an outcome variable using a cor-
relation or comparable index. In these studies, Allen and colleagues observed that
the primary indicators of objective career success were total annual compensation,
salary growth (e.g., percentage change over some time period), and self-reported
promotions. The primary indicants of subjective career success were career satisfac-
tion, advancement expectations, career commitment, job satisfaction, and intention
to stay with one’s organization.

Allen and colleagues’ (2004) results indicated, first, that individuals who have been
mentored receive greater career outcomes than those who have not, including both
objective and subjective outcomes (with the exception of intention to stay). Second,
results indicated that career-related mentoring was positively related to career out-
comes, including compensation, salary growth, promotions, career satisfaction, job
satisfaction, and satisfaction with the mentor. Third, the analyses indicated that psy-
chosocial mentoring was also related to career outcomes (as hypothesized).
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Allen and colleagues (2004) had predicted that objective career outcomes would
have a stronger relationship with career mentoring than with psychosocial mentor-
ing. The results indicated mixed support. Compensation and promotions were
slightly more strongly related to career than to psychosocial mentoring, although
the removal of one large sample study indicated a much larger difference in the
expected direction. Finally, the authors predicted that subjective career outcomes
would be more strongly related to psychosocial mentoring than to career mentor-
ing. However, the results provided little evidence that subjective career outcomes
are more strongly linked to psychosocial versus career mentoring. In contrast,
results indicated that psychosocial mentoring does appear to be related more
strongly to satisfaction with mentoring than does career mentoring.

In summary, Allen and colleagues (2004) provided evidence, based on over 40
empirical studies, that mentoring is associated with protégés’ receipt of both objec-
tive and subjective outcomes, although the effect sizes for objective outcomes tend
to be small. The most consistent benefits of mentoring appear to be the relation-
ships with affective reactions at work and positive feelings about one’s career. It also
appears that the type of mentoring (e.g., career versus psychosocial) may be impor-
tant for outcomes, in that there is some evidence that objective outcomes are more
strongly linked to career than to psychosocial mentoring. Allen et al. also made the
interesting observation that effect sizes for objective indicants of career success
were stronger when comparing “mentored versus nonmentored” individuals, as
opposed to studies of the connection between mentoring functions provided and
objective outcomes. They pointed out that, first, degree of mentoring provided may
not be as important as the presence of a mentor and, second, current operational-
izations of mentoring functions do not capture all aspects of mentoring that are
related to career success. In this vein, some qualitative research has identified a vari-
ety of mentoring behaviors that may be important, such as provision of network-
ing opportunities and breadth of skill development, which are not adequately
captured by mentoring scales in common use (Eby & McManus, 2002). Finally,
Allen et al. (2004) suggested that career mentoring is just as important for positive
job and career attitudes as is psychosocial mentoring.

Mentoring and Career Outcomes:
Characteristics of Studies and Implications

Considering the 47 studies of mentoring and protégé outcomes shown in Table 3.1,
we offer some summary observations about this literature. First, the overwhelming
majority of these studies used samples of managerial and professional employees.
The sample sizes ranged from 77 to 3,220, with the median at slightly over 200,
including a few studies collecting data from mentor-protégé dyads. Virtually every
study collected self-report data from protégés, with a few also collecting data from
mentors. Almost all of the studies provided some kind of definition of a mentor to
respondents. In addition, about 75% of the studies measured mentoring functions
received using a multi-item scale. Almost all of the studies were cross-sectional

Mentoring and Career Outcomes——73

03-Ragins-45340.qxd  9/10/2007  3:17 PM  Page 73



studies (i.e., all data were collected on the same survey at one time). However, there
were six longitudinal studies. There were also several studies that examined mod-
erator variables, especially gender and race.

We find it interesting that researchers have used such a wide variety of scales to
measure mentoring functions. It appears that for more than one third of the stud-
ies, a unique scale was developed; there were 15 studies reporting scales with only
one or two uses among all the studies in the meta-analysis. The most popular scale
was that of Noe (1988), used in 12 of the studies, which measures career and psy-
chosocial functions. Scales by Dreher and Ash (1990) and Ragins and McFarlin
(1990) were cited in 4 and 3 (respectively) of the studies. Researchers would bene-
fit from some systematic analysis of the equivalence and relative strengths and
weaknesses of mentoring scales in use. As noted by Allen et al. (2004), these scales
tend to provide a variety of kinds of instructions to participants. Finally, many
studies did not specify or limit protégé self-reports of mentoring as to informal or
formal mentoring relationships. A handful of studies did explicitly investigate for-
mal mentoring relationships, and as Allen et al. observed, these formal and infor-
mal mentorships may not provide the same benefits.

Thus, Allen and colleagues’ (2004) meta-analysis of studies of mentoring and
career outcomes synthesized results typified by cross-sectional data collection from
a few hundred managerial-professional protégés, who self-reported informal and/
or formal mentoring received and their attainment of both objective and subjective
career outcomes. We refer to these study characteristics (and Table 3.1) in subse-
quent parts of this chapter. We next turn to a more substantive exploration of a
variety of conceptual matters.

Conceptual Issues in Mentoring Research

Where We Have Been in Defining Mentoring

The Concept of Mentoring and Mentoring Functions

Kram (1985) is the most often cited source for a definition of mentoring in the
workplace. The traditional mentor is considered to be a senior individual who pro-
vides guidance and assistance to a more junior individual (the protégé). Kram’s
analysis of qualitative data led to two broad categories of mentoring functions pro-
vided to a protégé: career and psychosocial functions. Career mentoring functions
involve specific mentor behaviors supportive of the protégé’s career progress, which
directly enhance the likelihood of the protégé becoming successful in his or her
career. Whereas career functions directly help the protégé succeed in his or her
career, psychosocial functions are more personal aspects of a relationship that tend
to enhance a protégé’s sense of professional competence and identity.

The vast majority of mentoring research in work organizations has adopted the
Kram framework, although there is some evidence suggesting that role-modeling
may be a third distinct function (Scandura, 1992). We also note that Kram did not
use the term mentor in conducting her research, out of concern that the word had
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too many nuanced connotations. Instead, she chose to ask about “developmental
relationships.” We believe that attention to definitional issues is important for mak-
ing future progress in understanding mentoring and career outcomes. We now turn
to this issue.

Examining Alternative Definitions of Mentoring

To provide a discussion of how researchers have defined informal mentoring, we
go beyond the studies in Table 3.1, drawing upon some recent work by Dougherty,
Turban, and Haggard (2005). They performed an assessment of the variety of defi-
nitions and approaches to defining mentoring in empirical articles on informal
workplace mentoring. In this effort, they examined articles appearing during the
period from 1990 to 2005 in the five journals in which the majority of workplace
mentoring studies have appeared. Their assessment was restricted to studies includ-
ing the protégé (i.e., not exclusively studying mentors). The studies investigated a
variety of aspects of mentoring in addition to protégé career outcomes, but we
believe that this assessment of how scholars define mentoring is relevant for this
chapter’s consideration of conceptual and methodological issues.

Dougherty and colleagues’ (2005) assessment revealed much variability as to the
definition of mentoring used in research. For example, although many studies pro-
vided detailed definitions to respondents, several researchers chose to simply ask,
“Do you currently have a mentor?” Some investigators also administered a mentor-
ing functions scale to protégés, to establish the amount of mentoring provided, thus
assuming that individuals who provide mentoring functions are in fact “mentors,”
which may or may not be the case. In the studies collecting data from protégés that
did include a definition of a mentor (73%), there was appreciable variety in the
definitions used. Not surprisingly, in these studies, the percentage of individuals
who identified themselves as having a mentor ranged from 23% to 81%—a likely
result of differing mentoring definitions and/or sample characteristics.

The variety of definitions of mentoring included several features that are espe-
cially notable. In regard to a focus on a specific mentor, the majority of definitions
asked whether the respondent had “a mentor,” thus implying one specific person.
However, some definitions indicated that only one person should be considered,
while others asked about mentoring received over the career history, especially
those studies using mentoring functions scales. As to hierarchy, some definitions
merely indicated that a mentor has “more” or “advanced” experience, implying
some hierarchical difference, while other definitions specified that the mentor is at
a higher level, although using varied terms such as influential, higher-ranking,
senior, and position of power. These terms do not all clearly identify just where in the
hierarchy the mentor is located. In addition, a handful of the studies included peers
as a source of mentoring. Similarly, in several studies, definitions specifically included
supervisors, whereas a few specifically excluded supervisors as mentors. About half of
the studies assessed did not mention the supervisor at all.

Mentoring definitions have also provided differing levels of detail in describing
mentoring functions received by protégés, with many including examples of both
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psychosocial and career functions, while others included only one. Interestingly,
more of these definitions specified career functions than psychosocial functions.
A well-exercised phrase was that a mentor is a person “committed to providing
upward mobility to your career.” Other definitions implied career support without
spelling it out. As to intimacy of the relationship, some (only a few) defined men-
toring relationships as being “close” or “intense.” Finally, most mentoring defini-
tions in research have either explicitly stated that the mentor is internal or at least
implied it, using a phrase such as “in your work environment.”

About a fourth of the studies measured mentoring functions using scales, with-
out an explicit definition of a mentor. These researchers avoided the variety of
connotations associated with the word mentor. However, the degree to which these
scales ask about a particular mentor versus “mentoring functions received” raises
the issue of whether the construct being measured is a mentoring relationship or,
alternatively, mentoring functions received from any number of sources.

There may be notable implications of the variety of definitions used in research
on mentoring and outcomes. Wanberg and colleagues (2003) pointed out that
although there is a lack of definitional consistency, there is consistency in the
general concept of mentoring, at least for traditional mentoring relationships.
Nevertheless, scholars need to carefully consider the definition(s) of mentoring they
present to research participants and consider the implications. We cite a few key
issues and examples.

Defining the Mentoring Construct:
Problems and Issues

The most obvious definitional problems for interpreting the literature stem
from use of a vague definition of mentoring in some studies (“Do you have a men-
tor?”) and in some cases no definition at all. With no definition, participants can
decide who does or does not meet the test of mentorship. For studies using vague
definitions, interpreting the results in comparison to other mentoring studies poses
a challenge for the researcher. That is, reviews of the literature and meta-analyses of
mentoring research are limited by this conceptual diversity, creating error variance
restricting our ability to effectively assess mentoring relationships and summarize
research findings.

In addition, there is a potential problem of vagueness even with studies that
measure specific mentoring functions received by protégés. For example, consider
studies that present a multi-item mentoring scale to participants, asking them to
report their receipt of (mostly “secondary”) mentoring assistance from multiple
mentors over their careers (e.g., Turban & Dougherty, 1994; Whitely et al., 1991).
Of course, the accuracy of participants’ memories over time may be suspect. And as
we discuss in more detail later in this chapter, such studies may be at least partly
measuring a kind of generalized career affect. Some individuals might even indicate
significant mentoring received (e.g., on scales), while not being able to name any
one individual they ever considered to be a mentor to them.

Similarly, there may also be problems with the use of clearly defined but highly
descriptive definitions of mentoring, such that the definitions of mentoring include,

76——MENTORING RESEARCH

03-Ragins-45340.qxd  9/10/2007  3:17 PM  Page 76



or strongly imply, the benefits received by protégés. Consider studies that include in
the definition of a mentor that this person has “helped you by supporting your
career” (Aryee, Lo, & Kang, 1999, p. 568) or definitions specifying that the person
“is committed to providing upward mobility and support to your career” (Baugh,
Lankau, & Scandura, 1996, p. 313). These descriptive definitions make sense for
studies addressing topics such as willingness to mentor others. But they may be
problematic for studies investigating mentoring and career outcomes received, in
that the very definition of mentoring includes the provision of these outcomes.
We acknowledge that one could also argue that this “common method variance”
problem derives from how we measure the outcome variables. Regardless, overlap-
ping content in the predictor and the criterion variables could artificially inflate
correlations.

In contrast, some researchers have used highly precise and/or narrow definitions
of mentoring, such as specifically excluding supervisors in definitions of mentor-
ing. Even with diverse definitions across studies, precise (versus vague) definitions
make it possible to better understand differing research results across studies.

It is likely that one agreed-upon, uniform definition of mentoring would be dif-
ficult, since mentoring falls along a range of quality. But whether studies include or
do not include specification of the scope of mentoring is likely to have implications
for their results. We cite a few examples. First, studies that define mentoring as
career mentoring only (versus psychosocial) may be more likely to find relation-
ships of mentoring with protégé career progress and less likely to find relationships
of mentoring with work attitudes (although Allen et al.’s (2004) meta-analysis
results did not support this prediction). Second, studies with mentoring definitions
allowing for or specifying direct supervisory mentoring may find differences com-
pared with nonsupervisory mentoring, such as protégés’ receipt of less sponsorship
and exposure/visibility, because of a direct supervisor’s limited power compared
with a top executive. However, supervisors might be able to provide more of some
career functions, such as coaching and challenging work. A few studies have found
differences in mentoring from supervisors versus others, although not necessarily
along the lines suggested here (Burke, McKenna, & McKeen, 1991; Ragins &
McFarlin, 1990; Tepper, 1995). A third example is that studies with definitions
allowing for outside-the-organization (“external”) mentoring might find less career
mentoring and less enhancement of protégés’ career progress. Each of these sources
of speculation could be empirically tested if there were enough studies using vari-
ous definitions and boundary conditions for what is considered to be mentoring.
Our purpose here is to underscore the potential importance of alternative defini-
tions of mentoring for our interpretation of the mentoring literature and compar-
isons among studies.

Defining Mentoring: Where We Should Be Going

The issues discussed above also lead to recommendations to researchers study-
ing workplace mentoring. Instead of providing only a vague definition of a mentor
or asking research participants to report on narrowly defined relationships—
thereby limiting the definition of mentoring a priori—researchers should gather
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data on the full range of relationships and then collect additional, more detailed
information describing the relationships. Researchers, for example, might ask about
a general developmental relationship and then gather more specific information
about the nature of this relationship (e.g., Is this person your supervisor, higher in
the hierarchy? Is it formal or informal, internal or external? Would the person see
himself/herself as a mentor?). Using this approach (see Ragins, 1999) would allow
researchers to capture the full range of mentoring relationships and provide a more
precise analysis. This approach would be consistent with Kram’s (1985) original
assertion that traditional mentoring is only one part of a person’s relationship con-
stellation including peers, family, subordinates, supervisors, and others. The approach
is also consistent with Higgins and Kram’s (2001) recent reconceptualization of men-
toring as a developmental network.

Conceptual Issues: The Criterion Problem

As shown in our previous discussion of the mentoring literature, researchers
have considered a variety of dependent variables in their studies of the benefits
associated with the establishment of mentoring relationships. These are often cate-
gorized as being either objective or subjective in nature. Common criterion vari-
ables of the objective variety typically include measures of protégé compensation
levels, salary growth, and promotion rates. Subjective measures typically include a
focus on career and job satisfaction along with protégé satisfaction with the men-
toring relationship. A few studies have also addressed protégé career commitment
and intention to stay with a current employer. And actual turnover has been con-
sidered as a direct outcome of mentoring (Payne & Huffman, 2005).

While prior research has covered a relatively wide range of outcome variables, we
first note that other interesting potential consequences would be worthy candidates
for future studies. For example, on the benefits side, we would suggest moving
beyond the organizational context and considering the effects of mentoring rela-
tionships on extraorganizational functioning and satisfaction. Here, a focus on life
satisfaction, the ability to balance the competing demands of a career and a family
(see Greenhaus & Singh, Chapter 21, this volume), and the ability to manage the
stressful nature of very competitive labor markets could lead to some interesting
findings. We also note recent calls for extending mentoring criteria to capture rela-
tional elements of mentoring as part of one’s set of “positive relationships” and the
experience of growth, learning, and development (Fletcher & Ragins, Chapter 15,
this volume; Ragins & Verbos, 2007). The consideration of negative and unintended
effects of mentoring also offers new insight. In this vein, we applaud some recent
research on the potential negative effects of mentoring, including exploitation and
sexual harassment of protégés (Eby, Chapter 13, this volume; Eby & McManus,
2002; Eby, McManus, Simon, & Russell, 2000). It also would be useful to study the
consequences for the protégé of being associated with a mentor experiencing vary-
ing degrees of career failure (e.g., being found in violation of accounting rules,
being discredited for initiating a failed strategic initiative, etc.).

Next, we point out that the mentoring literature has traditionally focused on
outcomes at the individual level of analysis. Mentoring might be considered at the
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group level also, and there is a clear need to consider mentoring from the perspec-
tive of employing organizations. What is intriguing here is the possibility that in
some situations, what is good for the individual protégé or mentor may not be good
for the organization. We offer two examples. First, consider the mentor who helps
the protégé by providing information about extraorganizational job opportunities.
By helping a protégé learn about a profession and the opportunities that reside out-
side the employing organization, high-quality mentoring may encourage voluntary
turnover. Of course, this outcome may be “bad” for one organization and “good” for
another organization, and it might ultimately result in a better person-organization
fit. Thus, the relationship between organizational mentoring programs and turnover
rates may be rather complex.

Also, we know virtually nothing about the ability of mentors to accurately iden-
tify high-potential job candidates. Conventional wisdom would suggest that the
establishment of a “mentoring/development-oriented culture” in an organization
would lead to improved talent pool management. An organization with a strong
developmental culture consciously uses work experiences and work relationships to
develop employees, has intense involvement by senior management, includes a
strong succession planning process, and empowers employees to be self-directed,
among other characteristics (see Hall & Mirvis, 1996). But if accelerated develop-
mental experiences are not being offered to the right individuals, talent pool man-
agement and the building of bench strength may be compromised. Systematically
studying the linkages between mentoring-oriented organizational culture and indices
of quality talent pool management could prove useful.

While the issues just discussed are important, we believe the most crucial issues
related to the criterion problem are represented by the distinction between distal
(long-term) and proximal (immediate) outcomes of mentoring relationships—a
set of processes that are proposed to mediate the relationships between mentoring
and outcomes represented in the literature. We turn our attention to this topic in the
final section of this chapter.

Research Design Issues: Internal Validity
and Method Variance Problems

Problems Presented by Cross-Sectional
Field Studies of Mentoring

As we discussed earlier in the chapter, the vast majority of studies of mentoring
and career outcomes are conducted as cross-sectional field studies. In this section,
we discuss a variety of design issues relevant to these kinds of studies.

Internal Validity: Direction of Causality

One key research issue in these studies of mentoring outcomes relates to what
could be placed under the category of internal validity. As Wanberg et al. (2003)
pointed out, researchers have sometimes used causal language in reference to
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cross-sectional mentoring findings, such as referring to mentoring as a significant
determinant of career success. There are several internal validity problems stem-
ming from the use of cross-sectional designs. One internal validity problem per-
tains to direction of causality. Mentoring researchers, while testing associations only
among variables, tend to interpret their findings as support for the notion that
receipt of mentoring leads to one’s career success, including outcomes such as
promotions, compensation, and career satisfaction. However, as has been noted in
reviews of the mentoring literature (e.g., Noe et al., 2002) we must acknowledge the
possibility that these associations among variables reflect a reverse direction of
causality—effects of protégé career success on receipt of mentoring. In this vein,
Noe et al. cited the study by Dreher and Ash (1990), in which protégés with self-
reported formal or informal mentoring relationships received more promotions
than those who did not specify mentoring relationships, regardless of protégé gen-
der. A reciprocal relationship could explain these results, such that early career suc-
cess leads to being chosen for mentoring by senior managers or being selected for a
mentoring program, thus enhancing protégé career success. In support of this line
of thinking, some research demonstrates that mentors tend to choose protégés who
are judged to be the highest performers (Olian, Carroll, & Giannantonio, 1993) and
protégés who have high ability and motivation, as opposed to protégés who are
most in need of assistance (Allen, Poteet, & Russell, 2000).

Clearly, longitudinal research is of great value in clarifying these causal direc-
tions. As we reported earlier (see Table 3.1), we identified only six studies of men-
toring and protégé outcomes that were not strictly cross-sectional, with mentoring
and outcome data collected at more than one time. Interestingly, these studies have
typically been supportive of the researchers’ hypothesized direction of causality. As
examples, studies have found that mentoring (or developmental relationships)
measured at one point in time was related to subsequent organizational commit-
ment and organizational citizenship (Donaldson, Ensher, & Grant-Vallone, 2000)
and to professionals’ promotion to partner 7 years later (Higgins & Thomas, 2001).
But as Allen et al. (2004) pointed out, we currently have little guidance as to the
appropriate time lag for capturing the receipt of mentoring outcomes.

Internal Validity: Alternative or “Third-Variable” Explanations

A related internal validity issue for mentoring research pertains to ruling out
alternative explanations for relationships of mentoring to career outcomes by tak-
ing other variables into account. Sometimes this is referred to as the problem of
“third-variable explanations” for relationships between two variables. We cannot
expect highly controlled experiments with random assignment to be feasible in the
study of informal mentoring. But there clearly is a need for research demonstrating
the extent to which mentoring is the unique driver of positive outcomes (Wanberg
et al., 2003). We note that some studies have used quite extensive sets of control
variables in cross-sectional studies of mentoring and outcomes, including human
capital variables (e.g., education), job and organizational variables, motivational
variables (e.g., hours worked per week), and demographic variables (see Dreher &
Ash, 1990; Turban & Dougherty, 1994; Whitely et al., 1991). The extensive use of
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control variables requires larger samples but allows for examining the incremental
value of mentoring for career success. It also allows for ruling out a considerable
number of potential third-variable explanations for relationships of mentoring
with career outcomes.

Nevertheless, we note that Wanberg et al. (2003) drew special attention to the
need for mentoring studies to control for key individual characteristics of protégés,
especially protégé ability and motivation, in examining the association of mentor-
ing with protégés’ career success. Few studies have controlled for these kinds of fac-
tors. Some studies have controlled for some aspects of ability, such as GPAs, test
scores, and graduates’ scholastic rankings. Similarly, some studies have examined
“proxies” for motivation, such as work centrality and hours worked per week. But
it appears that studies have not controlled for both protégé ability and motivation.
One exception is a study of faculty advisors’ career mentoring of doctoral students
and linkages to students’ career success (Green & Bauer, 1995). The researchers
controlled for ability using GRE scores, and for motivation using a measure of
doctoral-student commitment. When these factors were controlled, the relation-
ship of mentoring to career success (publications) was no longer significant.

Self-Reports and Method Variance Inflation of Relationships

In addition to internal validity issues, a second key research design issue in cross-
sectional mentoring studies stems from the predominant use of self-reports, usu-
ally from protégés, as the single source of data in studies of mentoring and career
outcomes. Because all data comes from the same source, we should expect some
inflation of observed relationships, resulting from several kinds of common
methods bias. We draw from excellent treatments of this issue by Podsakoff,
MacKenzie, Lee, and Podsakoff (2003) and Podsakoff and Organ (1986) in empha-
sizing some key sources of common methods bias we believe to be particularly rele-
vant for mentoring research.

First, in self-reports, people may try to maintain consistency between their cog-
nitions (e.g., receipt of mentoring functions) and their attitudes (e.g., perceived
career success, career satisfaction). This desire of respondents to maintain consis-
tency and appear to be rational in their responses is known as the consistency motif.
A second, related source of common method bias is referred to as illusory correla-
tions and implicit theories, meaning that respondents hold assumptions about how
constructs or events are related. Thus, in the case of mentoring research, the rela-
tionships of mentoring with outcomes may reflect the true covariation of mentor-
ing received with outcomes but also the implicit theories of respondents about the
relationship between these events. For example, some respondents who feel that
their careers have not been successful may also believe that (therefore) a lack of men-
toring support is a major cause of this failure. The use of self-report data on men-
toring and career outcomes in a cross-sectional survey provides ample opportunity
for implicit theories to affect the research results. We recall that mentoring tends to
be more strongly related to subjective indicators of career success (e.g., career satis-
faction) than it is to indicators of objective career success (Allen et al., 2004). We sug-
gest that one reason for these differential findings may be the various types of
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method variance inflation of relationships among subjective perceptions, especially
when collected on one survey at the same time. Again, separation of the measure-
ment of variables theorized to be causes from those seen as effects could be helpful.

A third source of method bias relevant for mentoring research is social desirabil-
ity, which refers to the tendency for respondents to respond in a way that presents
themselves in a favorable light (Crowne & Marlowe, 1964). Thus, mentoring
research participants who report attaining much success may feel a kind of internal
pressure to also report, as a socially desirable response, that they have been helped
along the way by powerful mentors—which may not be a true reflection of the way
they really perceive career events.

A final source of common method bias we discuss here is positive and negative
affectivity of respondents (see Podsakoff et al., 2003). As a relatively stable personal
characteristic, some people tend to view themselves and the world around them in
negative terms (negative affectivity), while others tend to regularly take a positive
view. These individual dispositions may influence observed relationships between
variables in self-report, cross-sectional studies. An example in a mentoring context
is that respondents with high negative affectivity may be more likely to report that
no mentors have helped their careers and also that they dislike their jobs (Wanberg
et al., 2003). A solution is to control for negative affectivity in multivariate analysis.
We should acknowledge here that it may also be true that protégés with high nega-
tive affectivity are, in fact, less likely to have mentors. It is also possible that a more
transient mood state of respondents at the time of completing a survey could result
in artifactual relationships among measured variables. Again, for a recent discus-
sion of these and other sources of common method bias, see Podsakoff et al. (2003).
We have emphasized some sources of method variance bias that are particularly
relevant for cross-sectional mentoring research.

External Validity and the Influence of
Key Moderator Variables

External Validity

As traditionally presented by authors such as Campbell and Stanley (1966),
issues of external validity have to do with interactions between treatments (in this
case the establishment of mentoring relationships) and (a) persons, (b) settings,
and (c) times. While we will stay within this framework when commenting on
external validity within the context of the mentoring literature, we note that a vari-
ety of variables (at the level of the developmental treatment itself) may moderate
relationships between mentoring and outcome variables—and to some extent,
these variables have already been addressed in the previous discussion of measure-
ment issues and the nature of the mentoring construct. For instance, the duration
and comprehensiveness of mentoring relationships would seem to have a lot to do
with whether or not “having” a mentor would lead to positive career outcomes.
Likewise, the payoff associated with developing a mentoring relationship would
seem to be highly dependent on a wide variety of mentor (and protégé) attributes.
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For example, high-quality mentoring relationships would seem to depend on
whether the mentor possesses accurate and meaningful information about the pro-
tégé’s organizational culture and strategic type and about the protégé’s chosen
career path. Also, whether or not the mentor is a skillful trainer would seem central
to understanding the possible returns associated with mentoring. Here, we are
thinking of behaviors such as listening, coaching, and communication skills. To
date, as illustrated in Table 3.1, very little empirical research has addressed these
possible moderators of mentoring/career-outcome relationships.

One topic that does relate directly to the nature of the mentoring construct itself
is the whole issue of the distinction between informal and formal mentoring.
Informal and formal relationships may differ on multiple dimensions (Ragins &
Cotton, 1999). The most obvious dimension is the way the mentoring relationship
is formed, with the former resulting from naturally occurring exchanges at work
or in other social and community settings and the latter resulting from some type
of matching process initiated within a company-sponsored mentoring program.
While little research has systematically addressed the formal/informal distinction,
the few studies that have suggest that the two may not be equally beneficial (Allen
et al., 2004; Chao, Waltz, & Gardner, 1992; Ragins & Cotton, 1999). Additional
research on this particular topic is clearly needed, including the increasing use of
“e-mentoring,” which is often a component of formal programs (see Ensher &
Murphy, Chapter 12, this volume).

Interaction of Selection and Treatment (Mentoring)

From the Campbell and Stanley (1966) perspective, the issue here is whether any
observed correlational or cause-effect relationships can be generalized beyond the
group or groups used in the initial research. That is, do the results from any parti-
cular study generalize to various racial, sex, social, geographical, age, or personality
groups? A review of Table 3.1 reveals that very little is currently known about this
class of moderator variables. The most commonly considered moderators are gen-
der and race, with gender being considered in some form in 13 of 47 studies and
race being considered in 4 instances. Other moderators such as mentor age, protégé
and mentor race, protégé influence tactics, and protégé socioeconomic origins have
received some, but less, attention. What is most striking is that 81% of the studies
represented in the Allen et al. (2004) review were conducted using U.S.-based
samples. Samples from Belgium, Great Britain, Canada, Hong Kong, Ireland, and
Singapore were singularly represented in the review, and two studies focused on
survey respondents from Australia. Geographical location may be relevant because
cultural-value differences are observed across geographical regions and these dif-
ferences may moderate mentoring/outcome relationships. Cultural differences may
also be related to the definition of mentor. In a recent study, Ramaswami, Huang,
and Dreher (2005) observed that power distance moderated the relationship
between mentoring and organizational level, such that among Taiwanese managers
and professionals (who are reasonably high on power distance), the positive return
associated with mentoring was strongest among high power distance protégés.
Programmatic research is needed to better understand whether the association
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between mentoring and career outcomes—most often studied within the context of
U.S. culture—will generalize to national cultures that differ from the United States
on an assortment of value and managerial-style dimensions.

Interaction of Setting and Treatment

Again, from the Campbell and Stanley (1966) perspective, this class of interactions
asks whether relationships observed in one setting will generalize to other settings.
Settings in this case typically refers to organizational, industrial, or occupational
settings. Many of the studies displayed in Table 3.1 were based on managerial/
professional samples (often drawn from North American alumni associations). This
type of sampling provides for some degree of heterogeneity across employing indus-
tries and occupations for protégés but tends to ignore large segments of the work-
force, such as clerical workers or service workers. We also know of no studies that have
explicitly hypothesized and systematically studied the moderating effects of industry
or occupation. We also note that there have been attempts to focus on more homo-
geneous samples. For example, Mobley, Jaret, Marsh, and Lim (1994) and Riley and
Wrench (1985) studied mentoring-outcome relationships among U.S.-based lawyers;
Prevosto (2001) studied U.S. Army reserve nurses; and Kirchmeyer (2005) studied
U.S. professors. While this work is useful from the external validity perspective, it does
not provide for a theory-based framework for understanding how the strength of
mentoring-outcome relationships may be sensitive to the types of firms, occupations,
and industries within which protégés pursue their careers. Here again, research
designs, and also new theoretical typologies, are needed. We summarize the set of
conceptual and methodological issues discussed in this chapter in Table 3.2.

Specifying Mediating Processes
and Moderator Effects

Mentoring’s Influence on Protégé Career
Trajectories: Five Paths

In the previous section on research design issues, we mentioned the difficulty of
interpreting direction of causality in cross-sectional research on mentoring and
protégé outcomes. Causal inferences about the positive effects of mentoring would
be more defensible if the mechanisms through which mentoring is proposed to
affect career outcomes were to become the focus of empirical investigations. That
is, while the suggested studies may still be dominated by cross-sectional field stud-
ies, it would be more persuasive to argue for the positive effects of mentoring if a
new class of criterion variables were shown to be correlated with mentoring expe-
riences. Ramaswami and Dreher (in press) have proposed frameworks for under-
standing the intermediate linkages between mentoring experiences and career
outcomes (for both the protégé and the mentor). They show five paths through
which mentoring relationships can influence the career trajectory of a protégé.
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Each path provides insight into what needs to be included in this new class of
criterion variables. In what follows, we summarize the central tenets of the
Ramaswami and Dreher protégé model and comment on some key moderator vari-
ables that have not received sufficient research attention.

Human Capital Path

Here, a variety of mentoring functions (i.e., providing challenging assignments,
coaching, and role-modeling) could serve to enhance the capability of the protégé.
The human capital path addresses the acquisition of job-related knowledge, skills,
and abilities (KSAs) that ultimately should enhance the protégé’s performance on
the job. This, in turn, would be expected to contribute to an assortment of career-
oriented benefits (e.g., increased salary and hierarchical advancement). What are
needed are research designs that allow for the simultaneous examination of the
structural paths making the connections between the various mentoring functions,
protégé KSA acquisition, job performance, and career attainment and success. Even
if these designs were not longitudinal, they would contribute to the literature. We
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Table 3.2 Summary of Key Conceptual and Methodological Issues in Studies of
Mentoring and Protégé Career Outcomes

Definitional No definitions of mentor and mentoring
Variability Vague definitions of mentor and mentoring

Narrow/exclusive definitions of mentor and mentoring

Criterion Need to focus more attention on:

Limitations • Extraorganizational functioning and satisfaction

• Positive relationships at work

• Negative/unintentional effects
of mentoring

• The organizational perspective

• Effective talent pool
management

Internal Validity Ambiguous direction of causality

Problems Alternative/third-variable explanation of relationships

Method Variance Consistency motif

Inflation Illusory correlations and implicit theories

Social desirability effects

Positive/negative affectivity

External Validity Interaction of selection and treatment (mentoring)

Constraints Interaction of setting and treatment
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know of no studies that have simultaneously examined the entirety of the human
capital path. In fact, we know of only one study that has examined a component of
this path. Ostroff and Kozlowski (1993) found that newly hired employees with
mentors had more knowledge about the technical and organizational attributes of
their business units than workers without mentors.

Movement Capital Path

A second way a mentor can enhance the career success of a protégé is to provide
the protégé with information about the range of intra- and interorganizational
opportunities that may exist in a labor market. The distinction between human
capital and movement capital is subtle. While movement capital can be represented
by increased knowledge (in this case, knowledge about labor market attributes),
this knowledge has little to do with direct forms of performance enhancement.
Movement capital helps the protégé to become more aware of available opportu-
nity in the labor market. The link to career outcomes comes through a better match
between capability and position requirements. Improvements in human capital
prove useful because job performance is improved, even when holding position
requirements constant. Past studies have shown that labor market mobility is
related to career attainment, at least for male managers and professionals (Brett &
Stroh, 1997; Dreher & Cox, 2000; Lam & Dreher, 2004). Although a few studies have
addressed components of this path by considering the relationships between men-
toring and organizational commitment, turnover, and perceived job opportunities
(e.g., Barker, Monks, & Buckley, 1999; Mobley et al., 1994; Payne & Huffman, 2005;
Prevosto, 2001), none has considered the entirety of the path. To do so would
require looking at mentoring and mobility from a career perspective, not from the
perspective of a particular job or organization.

Social Capital Path

At the heart of the social capital path is the increased degree of exposure and vis-
ibility for the protégé that is purported to be associated with establishing a rela-
tionship with a mentor. The human capital path involves changes in the protégé’s
capacity to perform work assignments; the movement capital path involves changes
in the protégé’s knowledge about labor market opportunity; and the social capital
path involves changes in relationships that make powerful decision makers more
knowledgeable about the protégé’s potential. Hard work, talent, and perseverance
would seem to be necessary attributes for success for individuals pursuing hierar-
chical career advancement. However, talent and hard work alone would not seem
to be sufficient for career progress. Powerful decision makers must become aware
of talented individuals before they can act to utilize this talent. Kram’s (1985) men-
toring functions of sponsorship, exposure and visibility, and protection seem well
suited to help protégés make connections and become part of the professional net-
works of high-level decision makers. Note, the key theme here is not that mentors
change the capability levels of their protégés; it is that mentors make senior-level
decision makers aware of protégé attributes. There would seem to be a variety of
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ways mentors can help protégés in this way. One is by carefully placing the protégé
in situations that will bring the protégé and senior-level managers and executives
into direct contact. Of course, this must be orchestrated such that the protégé is
prepared and ready to behave in ways that will impress the more-senior manager—
that is, the protégé should not be placed in situations that provide a reasonable like-
lihood of failure.

Other ways to help the protégé could take the form of explicit sponsorship. Here,
the mentor could work behind the scenes (note that in this situation, the protégé
may not have direct knowledge of the mentor’s behavior) in promoting the pro-
tégé’s interests. Nominating a protégé for a key promotion or work assignment or
building the case for a protégé during a meeting of a talent pool committee repre-
sent examples of behind-the-scene mentor behavior that could alter the career traj-
ectory of the protégé. Again, in this case, the actual behavior or capability level of
the protégé is not affected in any direct way.

The preferred way to examine processes associated with the acquisition of social
capital would be for researchers to directly gather information about mentor
behavior. This is the preferred way because protégés are often not good sources for
this type of information. While protégés can describe a wide range of mentor
behaviors, they are not always able to observe or be informed of what the mentor
does on their behalf when interacting with senior managers. Therefore, ways of
measuring mentor behavior that go beyond using protégé ratings and descriptions
of mentor behavior should be used and then combined with data about protégé
career success. We are not aware of any empirical research that has addressed this
class of questions in this particular way.

Another way to address the social capital path is to explicitly examine the role of
sponsorship and related mentor functions in fully estimated social capital/career
success models. The best example of this approach is the study by Seibert, Kraimer,
and Liden (2001). These researchers proposed a model of social capital effects on
career success and then empirically tested it using a sample of business and engi-
neering alumni. They used eight career sponsorship items from Dreher and Ash’s
(1990) global mentoring scale. Interestingly, their results showed that the structural
properties of social networks and the nature of the resources embedded in these
networks were antecedent to the role of career sponsorship in explaining career
success. That is, career sponsorship partially mediated the relationships between
network properties and three measures of career success. We would encourage
future researchers to consider in more detail the linkages between the functions of
mentoring and the properties of protégés’ social networks. These studies also
should take into account the notion of a developmental network (Higgins & Kram,
2001). The establishment of networks of diverse developers and mentors would
likely have a more powerful effect on the properties of protégés’ social networks
than would the establishment of a single or primary mentoring relationship.

Path-Goal Clarity

In addition to helping protégés develop job-related capability, organiza-
tional knowledge, and social networks, mentors may influence protégés’ sense of
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self-efficacy and other motivational states that could enhance career success. A
study by Day and Allen (2004) is an excellent example of research that has con-
sidered the effects of career self-efficacy and career motivation on the relation-
ships between mentoring functions and subjective and objective career outcomes.
Additional research designs that consider the relationships between the various
functions of mentoring and motivational states, such as self-efficacy, expectancy,
and instrumentality perceptions, would enhance our understanding of this
important mediating process. While the human capital path focuses on the devel-
opment of enhanced capability, this path focuses on the motivation to aggres-
sively pursue career objectives.

Values Clarity Path

By focusing on acceptance and confirmation, counseling, and friendship, men-
toring relationships can provide the protégé with the opportunity to reflect on and
make career and life choices within the context of guidance and feedback from
a more experienced individual. According to Schulz (1995), protégés can use their
mentors to test ideas about what constitutes realistic career goals and to think
through whether a current employing organization can support these goals. In
addition, discussions with mentors can prove useful when protégés attempt to clar-
ify the centrality of work and career relative to other personal and family-oriented
life goals. To the degree to which goal and value clarification contributes to making
sound personal and career-oriented decisions, mentoring activities related to this
path should contribute to life and career satisfaction. While some research has
addressed criterion variables of the career satisfaction and career commitment vari-
ety (e.g., Aryee, Wyatt, & Stone, 1996; Collarelli & Bishop, 1990; Ragins, Cotton, &
Miller, 2000), we know of no studies that have explicitly addressed the linkages
between mentoring, value clarification and change, life planning, and life and career
satisfaction.

Moderator Variables

Ramaswami and Dreher’s model (in press) also proposes that key moderator
variables must be taken into account if one is to understand which (if any) causal
path is activated and whether or not a mentoring relationship is of sufficient qual-
ity to trigger proposed cognitive, affective, or behavior responses. They speculate
that mentoring quality can be defined in terms of mentor attributes. Here, the focus
is on aspects such as (a) mentor knowledge about organizational politics and cul-
ture, (b) mentor knowledge about protégés’ chosen career paths, (c) mentor skill as
a trainer and developer, (d) mentor motivation and opportunity to provide devel-
opmental assistance, and (e) mentor power and hierarchical position. We concur
with their assessment and would like to add another likely key condition of men-
toring quality. Here, high-quality mentoring is likely to be a function of the men-
tor’s ability to accurately perceive what a protégé most needs and then being able to
deliver protégé-specific developmental solutions. While this discussion suggests
that these variables would be examined by introducing appropriate cross-product
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terms when conducting data analyses, in reality, this class of variables represents yet
another way of defining the mentoring construct.

We encourage researchers to devise ways of combining these dimensions of
mentor attributes into overall measures of mentoring quality and then using these
measures as the independent variables of interest. That is, low scores would repre-
sent no or very-low-quality mentoring, and high scores would represent mentoring
relationships of the highest quality. The use of measures of mentoring quality (ver-
sus presence or absence of a mentor) should produce mentoring-career outcome
effect sizes much larger than those reported in the literature to date.

Concluding Comments

In this chapter, our goal was to discuss “where we have been” in the study of men-
toring and protégé career outcomes and to explore a variety of ideas about direc-
tions for future research. We first provided an overview of the results of research
on mentoring and protégé subjective and objective career success, and a summary
of key characteristics of these studies. There are some clear boundary conditions
of this literature, in terms of samples, contexts, and variables studied. We next
addressed conceptual issues, beginning with a survey of the wide variety of defin-
itions of mentor and mentoring in the research literature, agreeing with other
recent recommendations for an approach to defining mentoring that allows for
capturing a broad range of developmental relationships, while also specifying the
particular types of relationships being studied. We also emphasized the need to
consider an expanded set of outcomes for protégés, especially extraorganizational
functioning, and outcomes of mentoring for organizations. We then reviewed key
methodological constraints in the literature, relating to internal validity, methods
bias, and external validity, and underscored needed improvements in the method-
ologies of future studies. Finally, we emphasized that this literature is notably defi-
cient in conceptualizing and investigating intermediate linkages in the relationship
of mentoring with protégé career success, providing a number of ideas about the
avenues by which a mentor can influence a protégé’s career trajectory. Throughout
the chapter, we have attempted to stimulate the reader’s thinking about where we
have been, where we need to go, and how we might get there in studying mentor-
ing and its vital role for protégés’ subjective and objective career success.
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